
 

 

    

NMH Competition: Leonardo
Reveals First Members of Team
AW149

    
Hanwha Defence Offers Latest
Variant of K9 for the British Army

Leonardo has announced the launch
of Team AW149 UK, its onshore
supply chain for the AW149 helicopter,
which is competing to meet the need...

    

South Korea’s Hanwha Defense has
formed an international partnership
with leading defence manufacturers in
the UK to develop a local variant...

        
        
        
        

    

Raytheon Wins UK MOD's High-
Energy Laser Weapon System
Contract

    
Nexter Highlights Caesar 8×8
Capabilities at DSEI

Raytheon UK has received a
demonstrator contract to provide a
High-Energy Laser Weapon System,
or HELWS, to the UK MDO...

    

Nexter, alongside partner Krauss-
Maffei Wegmann (KMW), is
showcasing the Caesar self-propelled
gun in its eight-wheel drive version
(8×8)...

        
        
        
        

    

4GD and Parrot Announce Strategic
Partnership      Hensoldt Unveils Multi-mission

Naval Radar "Quadome"
Close-combat immersive specialist
4GD has entered into a strategic
partnership with Parrot, an European
drone group.

    

At DSEI 2021, Hensoldt is highlighting
the capabilities of its newly developed
‘Quadome’ radar system for naval
surveillance and target acquisition.

        
        
        
        

    

360iSR and Canadian UAVs Team
Up for UAS Operations Training      Controp Provides iSea25HD

Systems to a European Coast Guard
    

360iSR and Canadian UAVs will jointly
offer what they claim to be the most
comprehensive Unmanned Aircraft
System (UAS) Operations Training...

    

Controp Precision Technologies has
delivered iSea25HD Systems to a
European Coast Guard, thereby
expanding its maritime activity...
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